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Background Health systems and services research by nursing
personnel could inform decision making and nursing care,
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providing evidence concerning quality of and patient satisfac-
tion. Such studies are rather uncommon in Cuban research insti-
tutes, where clinical research predominates.
Objectives Assess the results of a strategy implemented between
2008 and 2013 to develop nursing capacity for health policy
and system research in 14 national research institutes based in
Havana, Cuba.
Methods The study comprised four stages: description of
approaches to health systems and services research by nurses
worldwide and in Cuba; analysis of current capacities for such
research in Cuba; intervention design and implementation; and
evaluation. Various techniques were used including: literature
review, bibliometric analysis, questionnaire survey, consultation
with experts, focus groups, and workshops for participant
orientation and design and followup of research projects.
Qualitative information reduction and quantitative information
summary methods were used. Initially, 32 nursing managers par-
ticipated; a further 105 nurses from the institutes were involved
in research teams formed during intervention implementation.
Result Of all published nursing research articles retrieved, 8.9%
(185 of 2081) concerned health systems and services research,
of which 26.5% (49 of 185) dealt with quality assessment. At
baseline, 75% of Cuban nurses surveyed had poor knowledge of
health systems and services research. Orientation, design and
followup workshopsfor all institute teams developed individual
and institutional capacity for health systems and services
research. Post-intervention, 84.7% (27) of nurses reached good
knowledge and 14.3% (5) fair; institutional research teams were
formed and maintained in 9 institutes, and 13 projects designed
and implemented (11 institutional, 2 addressing ministerial-level
priorities) to research nursing issues at selected centers.
Conclusion A systematic strategy to build nursing capacity for
health systems and services research can be effective in involving
nurses in such research and in developing institutional support
for it, fostering compliance with Cuban and international pro-
fessional development priorities for nursing, as well as contrib-
uting to quality of patient services.
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